
Subject: Re: Remittance Invoice #2016-2
From: Miranda Paster
Date: 02/22/2016 02:33 PM
To: Jim Omahen
CC: Rick Scott <rick.scott@lacity.org>

Thank you.

On Mon, Feb 22, 2016 at 1:04 PM, Jim Omahen <jim@mediadistrict.org> wrote:
Rick, attached to this message is signed Remittance Invoice #2016-2 for $102,809.07 reimbursement to the Hollywood Media District.  Original
has been sent to you via postal mail.  Thanks.

--
Jim Omahen, Operations Manager
Hollywood Media District BID
1040 N. Las Palmas Ave.
Hollywood, CA  90038
Ph 323.860.0088
Fax 323.860.0089

MediaDistrict.org

-- 
Counting my blessings - Sing and be Happy Today!
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